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Warami, Grose View families 
 
CONGRATULATIONS MISS PROCOPIO 
 
As of Term 4, Miss Procopio will be a permanent 
member of staff at Grose View Public School.  
After teaching at our school for many years as a 
temporary teacher we have been able to secure 
her in a permanent capacity.  Miss Procopio is 
currently teaching Kindergarten, leads the 
Aboriginal Education Committee, organises our 
school sport program in Term 2 and, among many 
other roles, is our resident Mathematics whiz!  She 
is a valued member of the staff and adds to the 
richness and diversity of teaching and learning 
here at GVPS.  Congratulations Miss Procopio, 
you have worked extremely hard for this 
opportunity and we are very excited that you are 
going to be working with us for many years to 
come. 
 
STAFF PROFESSIONAL LEARNING 
 
We had a wonderful day of professional learning 
last Friday, as Grose View Public School hosted 
Assistant Principals from the 15 schools involved 
in the SoLaR (Science of Learning and Reading) 
project at our first ever Middle Leaders Day.  
Assistant Principals spent the day working 
collaboratively to understand the science of 
reading and developing consistent approaches to 
implement this science at each of the 15 schools.  
Thank you to our executive team who participated 
in the day to further their knowledge and 
understanding of how to effectively teach reading, 
while developing partnerships with Assistant 
Principals from other schools from across the 
Hawkesbury and Windsor principal networks.  This 
is very exciting work and we look forward to 
sharing our success with the community over the 
coming years as the project progresses. 
 
PARENT INFORMATION SESSION— 
KINDER TO YEAR 2 
 
An invitation is extended to parents/carers of 
students in Kindergarten, Year 1 and Year 2, to 
come  and  learn  about  how  reading  is  taught to 

students in K-2 and how parents/carers can 
support this learning at home.  The focus of this 
evening will be to understand the approach to 
teaching reading at GVPS and learn more about 
practical steps to help your child with their 
homework and to achieve excellence in English.  
This  session  is  a follow-on session from the 
Term 2 Parent Information Evening. 
 
We believe that working side-by-side with the 
community is pivotal in achieving outstanding 
educational  outcomes  for  all  our  students.  Your 

What’s on in Week 5? 

Tuesday 16 August 
Stage 2 Australiana Pioneer Village excursion 

Wednesday 17 August 
Zone athletics carnival 

3 Way Conferences 

Thursday 18 August 
Assembly 

Friday 19August 
Zone athletics carnival 

Parent/Carer Café 

Book Fair 

What’s on in Week 6? 

Monday 22 August 
Book Week commences 

Book Fair 

Tuesday 23 August 
Book Fair 

Wakakirri 

Wednesday 24 August 
Book Fair 

Book Character Parade 

Thursday 25 August 
Story Fiesta 

Peer Support 

Friday 26 August 
PSSA Chess 

Sunday 28 August 
Think Share Act working bee 
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attendance at this information evening is essential 
for us to support all families to understand how and 
why students are being taught at school, so that 
families are able to support learning at home.  
 
Date: Monday 29 August 
Time: 6.00 pm 
Who: Kindergarten, Year 1 and Year 2 

parents/carers 
Where: Grose View Public School Library 
Supper: Light refreshments will be provided – 

tea, coffee and nibbles 
 
We look forward to sharing this information with 
GVPS community members. 
 
 
HEALTHY LUNCH BOX 
 
We include Nutrition Snippets provided by the 
Cancer Council Healthy Lunch Box team in each 
newsletter.  The snippets are designed to help with 
providing students with healthy alternatives to 
lunch box favourites and support families to make 
healthy choices and reduce the chances of cancer 
in young people. 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

I hope everyone has an amazing week. 
 
Yanu.  Until next time, stay safe and be kind. 
 
 

Matt Carter 
Principal 
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CALENDAR 

Tuesday 16 August  Australiana Pioneer Village excursion—Stage 2 

Wednesday 17 August  Zone athletics carnival—field events, 1500 m, 800 m heats 
  Think Share Act 
   3.30 pm 3 Way Conferences 

Thursday 18 August   2.00 pm Assembly—reward cards, award badges and classwork awards 

Friday 19 August   Zone athletics carnival—track events 
   2.15 pm Parent/Carer café 
   3.00 pm Book Fair 

Monday 22 August  Book Week commences 
   8.40 am Book Fair open 
   3.00 pm Book Fair open 

Tuesday 23 August   8.40 am Book Fair open 
   3.00 pm Book Fair open 
  Wakakirri 

Wednesday 24 August  Book Character Parade 
  Book Fair open 

Thursday 25 August  Story Fiesta 
  Peer Support 

Friday 26 August  PSSA chess round robin 

Sunday 28 August  Think Share Act working bee 

Tuesday 30 August  Allowah Day 
   6.30 pm Spring Fair meeting 

Wednesday 31 August  Think Share Act 
   2.00 Assembly—athletics awards 

Thursday 1 September   7.00 am Father’s Day Breakfast 
  Interrelate Session 1—Stage 3 
  Peer Support 

Friday 2 September  PSSA chess round robin 
  Book Week author visit 
   2.15 pm Parent/Carer cafe 

Tuesday 6 September  Hawkesbury Performing Arts Festival 

Wednesday 7 September  Check In assessment—Year 6 
  Think Share Act 

Thursday 8 September  Stage 3 Interrelate 

Friday 9 September  PSSA Chess 
  K-2 dog safety visit 

Wednesday 14 September  Think Share Act 


